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1520 sth Street SE - Watertown SD 572A1

OfficelFax # (605) 886-4503 - Shop #886-6201
Randy (Cell) 880-5402- Rita (Cell) 881-4733- Roy (Celt) 880-8213

FILEDFebruary 5, 2O2O

Hand County Hwy. Dept.
810 E. znd St.
Milter, SD 57362

Attn: Jeff H., County Hwy. Supt.
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Brownlee Construction, Inc. agrees to crush gravel for Hand
County Highway Dept. in 2020 at the enctosed Ctark County bid
price for 3/n" materiat.
Stripping, rectaiming and royatty not inctuded.

Minutes are enclosed as approved by Ctark County Commissioners
on February 4,2020.

Sincerety,

rowntee, Foreman
Browntee Const., Inc.



Clark County Courthouse
PO Box 294

Clark, SD 57225
Ph. 605-532-3667 or 505-233-0329

****All Bids are Due January 29,2020 at 10:00 a.m.{'**'t

Bids to be opened .January 29,2020 at 10:05 a.m. and bids to be considered by
the Clark County Commissioners February 4th,2020 at 8:00 a.m.

Csrtruction
5tft Street SE

5D 57201

Specifications for Gravel Crushing and Screenins
*Cclntractor agrees to and wiil abide by ali conditions and terms set forth by the Highway Superintendent.
*The gravel will be measured in tons to the nearest tenth of a ton as weighed on an accurate approved scale furnished bv the
contractor. The term "ton" shall mean the short ton consisting of 2000 pounds.

*Stockpiles will be placed in the general area of the pit from which the gravel is removed.
*Clark County will pay the Royalties to the pit owner for the gravel.

'Bid price shall include the cost of crushing and stockpiling.
rThe Board of Commissioners reserve the right to accept or reject any or all bids, and to waive anv defects or informalities if
deemed in the best interest of Clark County.

*clay will be added if deemed necessary by the clark county Highway superintendent.
rclark county is responsible for all stripping and reclaiming of the mlning location.

*****lfyou have any questions, please contact Ryan Eggleston, Highway Superintendent at 605-233-0329***,r*
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSU RANCE
THIS CERTIFICATE !S ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSU|NG TNSURER(S), AUTHORTZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.
IMPORTANT: lf the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
lf SUBROGATION lS WAMED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer to the certificate holder in lieu of such

PROOUCER

Fischer, Rounds & Assoc. Inc- Watertown
PO Box 1625
Watertown SD 57201

INSURED BROWCON-O

Brownlee Construction, lnc.
R&RTestinglnc.
1520 sth St SE
Watertown SD 57201

CERTIFICATE NUMBER:1
THls ls ro CERTIFY THAT THE PoLlclES oF INSURANCE LtsrED BELow HAVE BEEN tssuED To rHE TNSURE- NAMED ABovE FoR THE Foltcv pentoo
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE TNSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

.LArM'-MADE I X-] o""r*

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER

"o.,"" fl5F3i l-l ,o"

AUTOilOBILE LIABIL|TY

OWNEO I I SCHEDULED
AUTOSONLY I IAUTOS
HIRED lvlNoN-OWNED
AUToSoNLY | ^ lAUTosoNLy

BODILY INJURY (Per person)

BODILY INJURY (Per a@ident)

OCCUR

CLAIMS-MADE

WORKERS COTIPENSATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABLTTY
ANYPROPRIETORYPARTN ERYEXECUTIVE
OFFICEFYMEMBER EXCLUDED?
(Mandatory in NH)
lf yes. describe under

DESCRIPTKTN OF OPEMTONS / LOCATIONS / VEHIGLES (ACORD 101, Addittonal Rerclks Schedule, may be attached tf more spae is rcqutred)
Workers Compensation Excluded Offiicers:
Randy Brownlee
Rita Brownlee

HOLDER CANCELLATION

Hand County Highway Dept
810 2nd Street
Miller SD 57362
USA

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELTVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

@ 1988.2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
The AGORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORDACORD 25 (2016/03)
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CLARK COUNTY COMMISSIONER PROCEEDINGS

FebnunY 4,2020

Auditor Tarbox called the regular me*ing to order on Febnrary 4,20?0 at 8:00 a.m' in the

esmnrission€rs, mceting rooi of the Clark County Courthouse. Comrnissiouer Sass called the

mceting to ords at 8:00Lm. Commissioner$ Frcsent Robert Bjuke, Ricbard Reints, Franois Hass,

Chis Sass and Wallace l&rock, also prescnt Auditor Tarbox'

ASENDA: Motion by Reirrts, second by Bjerke to apprcve agenda for Febnrary 4,2g}g. All voting

aye. Motiou carried.

MIFILLFSI Motiou by l(nock, second by Reiuts, to apprrove the minrrtes of the regulat meeting of

January zL,hOZA. Ail members voting aye. Motion sarried.

HIGqW, AY: HS Eggleston met with the board to update thEm on roed conditions and work being

done.

HIG.-FT,yAY YEARLY BIDS: HS Eggleston preseirted the following qrrotes thd urcre reoeived ald

"p.rcd 
Uy e"Ott"t f*U"*JIi* superiutendent Eggleston and Highway Secetary Sohpller'

Brush on January 29,2020.411bids sre on file inthe Atrditot's office.

PAVER LAID ASPIIALT: Ciass D Type II with 20% RAP and PG 58-28 oil: Asphalt

Pav'rng & lvlatedals - 94.00/torL Lien Transportation - 175.00/toq Duininck Incorporated -
ts1.g1ltnn Bitgminous Paving - 114.00/ton. Motion by , second by to aflprove the low bid of
Asphatt Paving and Matsrials. AII voting aye. Motion carried.

IUASTIC SEAI"ANT: Borless - Brock White - .63 per pound. Mstion by , secoard by to

accept tbe bid of Brock White. All votiqg aye. Motion caried.

CRACK SEALAFIT - Boxlcss - Brock White - .62 per pound. Motion by , second by to
sccept the bid of Brock White. AII voting aye. Motion canied.

PEA ROCI(: Northcrn Con Agg LLP+I Pea Rock/ton 5.75lTon. Motiou by Reints, second

by H"ss to acceptbid ofNorttrern C.on -Agg. All voting aye. Mohou carried.

LIQUID ASPHALT: Flint llills Resourccs - MC7O-No bid, MC800 575.291ton, MC3000

565,29/to*febro: MC70 - 808.42lTon, MC800 -653.42fTouMC3000- 603.42ltnn. Modon by '
sccond by to acc€ptthe low bid of Flint Hills for MC800 and MC 3000 and Jeb'ro for MC70' All
voting aye. Motion carricd.

II0T Mf,K AIIID COLD MIX: Asphalt Pavins & Materials -IIot Mix CLD-I WnA% RAP &
pG 5g-29 $66.00/Ton, Hot Mix{LD-I (VIRGII.I") & PG 58-28 $70.50ffqn, Hot mix-cLEII
(VIRGINT) & PG 58-28 $73.00/Ton" Hot Mix-CLBIIwlZOVa RAP & PG 58-28-$68.50/Ton. Cold

Mix: No bid. Lien Transportation - Hot Mix 70.00/TotU Cold Mix - no bid' Duininck Inc: Hot Mix -
76.00/Ton, Cold Mix- 150.00/ton. Itdotion by , second by to acc€et all bids based on availability and

location. All voting ayo.Itdotion oanied.



January 7,2O2O

GRAVEL CRUSEING: Brownlee Construstiot-t/r" crushing -Z.l?pet ton. t" Soteen-

L7j/ tan,Motion by , second by to accept the bid of Brownlee Consfirrction for gravel cnrshing. All

vonng aye. Modon caried.

CONSTRUCTION COSTS: Clausen & Sons Coustuction'Tnrck/hr 115'00, Blade/hr

150.00, Excavator/lu 1i0.00, Front End Loader/hr 150,00, Dozer/hr 150.00, Suaper/hr 225.00' Belly

Dump/hr 15.00, Side dumpAr 115.00, Semi with Pup- 1251fu, Rip R.ap in place/ton 34'00, Fabnc

in place/sy 2.00, Lien fransportation: Truck/hr I15.00, Bladc/hr 235,00, Excavator/tr 195.00, Front

EnO l-oageyhr Zi1.00,Dozrlr/hr200.00, Belly Dump/b 175.00, Side dumpA[ 195.00, Semi with pup

195.00/h. Clausen Constnrction Inc: Truck/hr - 95.00, Bladetr - 165.00, Excsvator/k - 155'00'

Frorrr End Loader/lu - 150.00, Dozntlhr- 155.00, SeraperAr- 240.00,Belly Dump/lu- 130.00, Side

Drrmp/hr 130.00, Rip Rap in place/ton 40.00, Fabric in place/sy-2.l 5 sq yd, re st Exoavanng -
Truck/hr 100.00, Blade/hr 12!.00, Excavator/hr l75.OO, Front End Loader/hr 175'00, Dozntlbx -
200.00, Belly Duurp/hr -115.00. Belly Durrp-125.0}/ht. Joltrson Trucking -belly dump - 98.00/h'

Motron by , second by to reject Lien's bid and to accept bids based on availability frorn Clausen and

Sons Construotron, Forest Excavating and Joh+son Trucking. All voting aye. Motion carried.

FUEL OUOTES: The following firel quotes were presented to tlre board forFebruary 2020. Diesel

#1-70130: Clark Coputy Famrers Elevator,2,35, Clark Corununitf Oil- 2.33, Diesel #2: Clark

Corrnty Farrners Elevator -2.22, Clark Comrnunity Oil - 2.199. Gas- E 10: Clark County Farmers

Elevator: no bid. Clark Community Oil-l.945. The Courrty accepted the low bid and all bids ate on

file in the Auditor's office.

QI,AIIVIS, Motion by , second by to approve the following claims and allow ths auditor to issue

p"V**tr for same. All voting aye. Motion carried. COMMISSIONERS: TOTAL: 221,970,73.

pAYROLL: COMMISSIONERS: 8283.52,AUDITOR:3780.27, TRBASLJRER:3601.66, STATES

nffOnlfEY:373I.22,COURTI{OUSE: 1989.04, DIRECTOR OF EQUAIIZATION: 4959.20,

REGISTER OF DEEDS: 3569.30, VETERAI.IS OFFICER:363,82, SHERIFF: 7782.90, POOR:

450.08, NURSE: Z052.83,AMBULANCE:13,142.43, EXTENSION: 1068.23' WEED; 483'25,

PLA}INING & ZONING : 303 .22, ROAD & BRIDGE : 45,989,43, TOTAL : 1 O I,560.40'

ADJOURN: Motion by , second by to adjoum at l2;01 p.m, until next regular meeting Tuesday,

February 18, 2020 at 8:00 am. Members present voting aye. Motion carried.

ATTESTI

(SEAL)

Christine Tarbox
Clark County Auditor

Chris Sass, Cbainnan
Clark Corurty Board of Corrunissioners

Published onoe at the total approxiruate cost of $

965


